Bid Tabulation

Sump Pump Amensty Program - Contract 2
Areas 5B, 5D and 15
Contract No. 0130620

CORRECTED MATH

Moriarty & Sons, Inc.

D & C Construction Co. Inc.

Gravity Construction

Item Number Quantity |Description Price Each Extd Price Price Each Extd Price Price Each Extd Price
1 1 Mobilization and demobilization $ 27,500.00 $§ 27,500.00 (S 25,000.00 S 25,000.00|S 15,000.00 S 15,000.00
2 Installing new On-Site Infiltration System, Private Inflow
17 Removal and Sump Pump Discharge Redirection to the
new On-Site Infiltration System S 9,000.00 §$ 153,000.00(S 7,910.00 S 134,470.00|S 8,500.00 S  144,500.00
3 Private Inflow Removal and Sump Pump Discharge
Redirection and Connection to the Existing Drainage
System NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.1 1 74 Amherst Avenue S 6,500.00 § 6,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00
3.2 1 46 College Farm Road S 6,500.00 § 6,500.00|S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00
33 1 63 Indian Road S 6,500.00 $§ 6,500.00|S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
34 1 86 Indian Road S 9,000.00 § 9,00000(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.5 1 89 Indian Road S 8,500.00 § 8,50000(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.6 1 78 Lake Street S 8,500.00 § 8,50000(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 7,500.00 S 7,500.00
3.7 1 103 Lake Street $ 10,500.00 $§ 10,500.00 S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.8 1 120 Lake Street $ 9500.00 § 9,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00
3.9 1 126 Lake Street S 9500.00 § 9,500.00|S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 7,000.00 S 7,000.00
3.10 1 133 Lake Street $ 11,500.00 $§ 11,500.00 (S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.11 1 48 Lakeview Terrace $ 7,500.00 $§ 7,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,500.00 $ 6,500.00
3.12 1 52 Lakeview Terrace $ 11,500.00 $§ 11,500.00 (S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 7,000.00 S 7,000.00
3.13 1 53 Lakeview Terrace $ 9500.00 § 9,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,500.00 $ 6,500.00
3.14 1 59 Lakeview Terrace $ 7,500.00 § 7,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.15 1 60 Lakeview Terrace S 8,000.00 § 8,00000(S 730200 S 7,302.00]|S 5,500.00 S 5,500.00
3.16 1 598 Lexington Street $ 7,500.00 § 7,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 6,500.00 $ 6,500.00
3.17 1 107 Mokema Avenue S 8,000.00 $§ 8,00000(S 730200 S 7,302.00]|S 6,500.00 $ 6,500.00
3.18 1 50 Mount Walley Road S 6,500.00 $§ 6,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,000.00 $ 6,000.00
3.19 1 98 Princeton Avenue $ 7,500.00 § 7,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 9,000.00 S 9,000.00
3.20 1 104 Princeton Avenue $ 7,500.00 § 7,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00|S 6,500.00 $ 6,500.00
3.21 1 105 Princeton Avenue S 8,500.00 § 8,50000(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 8,500.00 S 8,500.00
3.22 1 33 Seminole Avenue S 8,500.00 § 8,50000(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00]|S 7,500.00 S 7,500.00




Contract No. 0130620

Moriarty & Sons, Inc.

D & C Construction Co. Inc.

Gravity Construction

Item Number Quantity |Description Price Each Extd Price Price Each Extd Price Price Each Extd Price
3.23 1 49 Seminole Avenue S 850000 S 8500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.24 1 26 Shore Road $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.25 1 6 Wampum Avenue S 850000 S 8,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00
3.26 1 8 Wampum Avenue S 850000 S 8,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00
3.27 1 100 Longfellow Raod S 8,000.00 S 8,000.00(S 730200 S 7,302.00(S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.28 1 26 Bruce Road S 7,500.00 $ 7,5500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.29 1 71 Stone Road $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.30 1 4 Allen Road S 850000 S 8500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 8,000.00 $ 8,000.00
3.31 1 78 Whitman Road S 9,00000 $ 9,000.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 8,000.00 $ 8,000.00
3.32 1 25 Hagar Lane S 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00
3.33 1 84 Whitman Road S 950000 $ 9,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 8,500.00 $ 8,500.00
3.34 1 19 Hagar Lane S 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.35 1 61 Stone Road S 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 7,000.00 $ 7,000.00
3.36 1 160 Longfellow Road S 850000 S 8,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
3.37 1 18 Mount Walley Road $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00(S$S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 6,000.00 S 6,000.00
3.38 1 22 Shore Road S 950000 $ 9,500.00(S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 8,000.00 $ 8,000.00
3.39 1 16 Wampum Avenue S 10,000.00 S 10,000.00 S 7,302.00 S 7,302.00 (S 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00

a 3 Private Inflow Removal and Sump Pump Discharge
Redirection and Connection to the New Storm Drain S 7,500.00 $ 22,500.00(S$ 7,910.00 $ 23,730.00 | S 7,000.00 S 21,000.00
> 163 |New Storm Drain Piping (12" RCP), and Appurtenances | o oo 00 ¢ 2526500 |8 100.00 $ 16,300.00 | $ 14000 $  22,820.00
6 1 Environmental Protection and Controls $ 750000 $ 7,500.00(S$ 8,000.00 S 8,000.00 ]S 6,500.00 S 6,500.00
7 50 Rock Excavation and Disposal S 200.00 S 10,000.00 | $ 225.00 $ 11,250.00 | S 75.00 $ 3,750.00
8 1 All Other Work/Remaining Lump Sum Items $ 15,000.00 $ 15,000.00|$ 8,000.00 S 8,000.00|S$ 2,500.00 S 2,500.00
9 300 Police Detail Allowance S 50.00 $ 15,000.00 | $ 50.00 $ 15,000.00 | $ 50.00 $ 15,000.00
10 10 Cut and Splash Roof Leaders Allowance S 1,000.00 $ 10,000.00 | S 100.00 $ 1,000.00 | S 1,000.00 S 10,000.00
Company Total $ 611,265.00 $ 527,528.00 S 496,070.00




