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Base of Award

Company Base Bid Total Bid Alternate A (1), 
per day

Alternate A (2) 
per day

Alternate A (3) 
per day

Alternate B,    
per hour

Alternate C,   
per hour

Alternate D,   
per hour Comments

Illinois Central School Bus 2,293,200.00$    323,071.00$         2,616,271.00$    455.00$                455.00$                455.00$                93.89$              34.70$             78.87$             
Eastern Bus Company 2,414,160.00$    399,450.00$         2,813,610.00$    479.00$                479.00$                479.00$                100.00$            40.00$             100.00$           

Delta 120,960.00$        76,379.00$           197,339.00$        24.00$                   24.00$                   24.00$                   6.11$                5.30$               21.13$             

Base of Award

Company Base Bid Total Bid
Alternate A (1), 

per day
Alternate A (2) 

per day
Alternate A (3) 

per day
Alternate B,    

per hour
Alternate C,   

per hour
Alternate D,   

per hour Comments
Illinois Central School Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Eastern Bus Company 2,363,760.00$    399,450.00$         2,763,210.00$    469.00$                469.00$                469.00$                100.00$            40.00$             100.00$           

Low bid computation is based on 
the Base Bid Amount plus the 

amount for the Athletic Events/Field 
Trips

Low bid computation is based on 
the Base Bid Amount plus the 

amount for the Athletic Events/Field 
Trips

Bid for Athletic 
Events/ Field 
Trips Transp.

BUSSES WITHOUT SEAT BELTS

This information is provided only as a record of the offers made by the respective companies. No inference should be made as to the award or rejection of offers. Companies' offers  have yet to be determined qualified and 
responsive. 
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