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19.00$                   2000 38,000.00$       
19.00$                   2000 38,000.00$       
19.00$                   2000 38,000.00$       Vanaria, Less by

114,000.00$     34,800.00$                   

7.20$                     11000 79,200.00$       
7.20$                     11000 79,200.00$       
7.20$                     11000 79,200.00$       Vanaria, Less by

237,600.00$     141,900.00$                 

Logs & Butts
Year 1 9.00$                     500 4,500.00$          
Year 2 9.00$                     500 4,500.00$          
Year 3 9.00$                     500 4,500.00$          

13,500.00$       

Year 1 23.80$                   2000 47,600.00$       
Year 2 24.80$                   2000 49,600.00$       
Year 3 25.80$                   2000 51,600.00$       

148,800.00$     

Year 1 11.00$                   11000 121,000.00$     
Year 2 11.50$                   11000 126,500.00$     
Year 3 12.00$                   11000 132,000.00$     

379,500.00$     

Year 1 NO BID 500 NO BID
Year 2 NO BID 500 NO BID
Year 3 NO BID 500 NO BID

NO BID

Year 3

Extended Total
Estimated 
Cub. Yrds

Anthony Vanaria & Sons
Street Sweepings

Year 1
Year 2

Street Sweepings
LoRusso Corp

Company

Leaves, Grass, Brush, Wood Chips
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Unit Pricing

BID RESULTS, Collection and Disposal of Leaves, Grass, Brush, Wood Chips, etc.,        Nov. 14, 2017

COMMENTS

Leaves, Grass, Brush, Wood Chips

Logs & Butts

TOTAL, 3 Yrs.  Loggs & Butts

Total, 3 yrs., Logs & Butts

TOTAL, 3 Yrs.  Street Sweepings

TOTAL, 3 Yrs.  Leaves, Grass, etc.

TOTAL, 3 Yrs.  Street Sweepings

TOTAL, 3 Yrs.  Leaves, Grass, etc.
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