BID RESULTS - 36 Months Lease for 28 Photocopiers, MONTHLY PRICE 26-Apr-17
Bid $ for | # of Bid $ for | # of Bid $ for  # of GRAND . Comments
Company 45 PPM | Units Total 65 PPM | Units Total 80 PPM | Units Total JOTAL Optional Features *
Kyocera $143.44 2 $286.88|$219.97 12 $2,639.64|S 241.32 14 $3,378.48 | S 6,305.00 |$32.28, $32.28, $32.28
Axion Bus. Technologies $148.00 2 $296.00 | $ 215.00 12 | $2,580.00 | $ 308.00 14 $4,312.00 | S 7,188.00 |$31.55, $32.44, $34.67
ITS Xerox $223.95 2 $44790|$317.40 12 | $3,808.80 | $ 394.65 14  $5,525.10 | S 9,781.80 |$8.20, $8.20, N/A,
NECS $195.00 2 $390.00 | $ 308.00 12 | $3,696.00 | $ 415.00 14 $5,810.00 | S 9,896.00 |$37.00, $37.00, $37.00
Automated Bus. Solutions | $159.50 2 $319.00 | $346.50 12 | $4,158.00 | $ 513.50 14  $7,189.00 | $11,666.00 |$19.10, $19.10, $19.10
Ricoh S - 2 S - S - 12 | §$ - S - 14 | S - S - Disqualified, No Original Signatures
Konica Minolta No Bid 2 S - No Bid 12§ - No Bid 14 'S - No Bid No Bid No Bid

Models Proposed

* Prices reported for

Kyocera each 45 PPM, 65 PPM
45 PPM Taskalfa 5002i and 80 PPM
65 PMM Taskalfa 7002i
80PPM Taskalfa 8002i
ITS XEROX
45 PPM Xerox Work Cntr5955i
65 PMM |  Xerox Work Cntr5875i
SQPPM Xerox DI5A ———— This information is provided only as a record of the offers made by the respective companies. No inference
Automated Bus. Solutions
45 PPM Not Indicated should be made as to the award of offers.
65 PMM Not Indicated
80PPM Not Indicated
Axion Bus. Technologies
45 PPM Not Indicated
65 PMM Not Indicated
80PPM Not Indicated
NECS
45 PPM Samsung k7400 Does Not meet specs

65 PMM Cannon Image Runner 6575i

80PPM | Cannon Image Runner 8505
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