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Date: 12/22/2016

Estimated Estimated Estimated
32 Gal   # of Units Total Cost 64 Gal   # of Units Total Cost 96 Gal   # of Units Total Cost TOTAL BID

COMPANY Unit $ 5000 32 Gal units Unit $ 17,500 64 Gal units Unit $ 2,500 96 Gal units ALL SIZES Comments

1 Toter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 Cascade Engineering 46.66$    5000 233,300.00$ 51.84$  17500 907,200.00$           59.30$    2500 148,250.00$   1,288,750.00$   
3 Schaefer Systems 123.27$  5000 616,350.00$ 66.09$  17500 1,156,575.00$       224.07$  2500 560,175.00$   2,333,100.00$   See Note 1

4 Rehrig Pacific Co. 47.80$    5000 239,000.00$ 54.35$  17500 951,125.00$           59.71$    2500 149,275.00$   1,339,400.00$   

Note 1

BID RESULTS: Purchase of Up to 25,000 Recycling Bins, Different Sizes

This information is provided only as a record of the offers made by the respective companies. No inference should be made as to the award or rejection of offers.

Cost of service was bid as a separate charge and added in the base price to arrive at a number comparable to the other bids. Includes Service Charge
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