
YEAR 1 15.70$                               235,500.00$                     YEAR 1 7.49$                                 112,350.00$                     YEAR 1 12.75$                               191,250.00$                     YEAR 1 8.00$                                 120,000.00$                     
YEAR 2 15.80$                               237,000.00$                     YEAR 2 7.99$                                 119,850.00$                     YEAR 2 13.00$                               195,000.00$                     YEAR 2 8.00$                                 120,000.00$                     
YEAR 3 16.00$                               240,000.00$                     YEAR 3 8.49$                                 127,350.00$                     YEAR 3 13.25$                               198,750.00$                     YEAR 3 8.00$                                 120,000.00$                     

712,500.00$                     359,550.00$                     585,000.00$                     360,000.00$                     

YEAR 1 16.00$                               32,000.00$                       YEAR 1 11.90$                               23,800.00$                       YEAR 1 12.00$                               24,000.00$                       YEAR 1 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       
YEAR 2 16.50$                               33,000.00$                       YEAR 2 12.90$                               25,800.00$                       YEAR 2 12.50$                               25,000.00$                       YEAR 2 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       
YEAR 3 16.75$                               33,500.00$                       YEAR 3 13.90$                               27,800.00$                       YEAR 3 13.00$                               26,000.00$                       YEAR 3 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       

98,500.00$                       THREE YEAR TOTAL 77,400.00$                       75,000.00$                       90,000.00$                       

YEAR 1 32.00$                               80,000.00$                       YEAR 1 22.94$                               57,350.00$                       YEAR 1 19.50$                               48,750.00$                       YEAR 1 37.00$                               92,500.00$                       
YEAR 2 32.50$                               81,250.00$                       YEAR 2 23.94$                               59,850.00$                       YEAR 2 20.50$                               51,250.00$                       YEAR 2 37.00$                               92,500.00$                       
YEAR 3 33.00$                               82,500.00$                       YEAR 3 24.94$                               62,350.00$                       YEAR 3 21.50$                               53,750.00$                       YEAR 3 37.00$                               92,500.00$                       

243,750.00$                     179,550.00$                     153,750.00$                     277,500.00$                     

YEAR 1 21.00$                               42,000.00$                       YEAR 1 12.90$                               25,800.00$                       YEAR 1 14.75$                               29,500.00$                       YEAR 1 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       
YEAR 2 21.50$                               43,000.00$                       YEAR 2 13.90$                               27,800.00$                       YEAR 2 15.25$                               30,500.00$                       YEAR 2 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       
YEAR 3 22.00$                               44,000.00$                       YEAR 3 14.90$                               29,800.00$                       YEAR 3 16.00$                               32,000.00$                       YEAR 3 15.00$                               30,000.00$                       

129,000.00$                     83,400.00$                       92,000.00$                       90,000.00$                       

Alternate 1 YEAR 1 17.00$                               110,500.00$                     YEAR 1 2.00$                                 13,000.00$                       YEAR 1 No Bid No Bid YEAR 1 8.00$                                 52,000.00$                       
YEAR 2 17.50$                               113,750.00$                     YEAR 2 2.50$                                 16,250.00$                       YEAR 2 No Bid No Bid YEAR 2 8.00$                                 52,000.00$                       
YEAR 3 18.00$                               117,000.00$                     YEAR 3 3.00$                                 19,500.00$                       YEAR 3 No Bid No Bid YEAR 3 8.00$                                 52,000.00$                       

341,250.00$                     48,750.00$                       No Bid 156,000.00$                     

1,183,750.00$             699,900.00$                905,750.00$                817,500.00$                

1,525,000.00$             748,650.00$                N/A 973,500.00$                

*This information is provided only as a 
record of the offers made by the respective 
companies. No inference should be made as 

to the award or rejection of any offers*

Tuesday, February 20th, 2024 at 10:00AM

BID RESULTS: Collection and Disposal of Leaves, Grass, Brush, Wood Chips, Street Sweepings, Logs and Butts, and Stumps 2024  
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  > Extended pricing for Collection and Disposal of Stumps 
corrected due to calculation error.

Anthony Vanaria & Sons, Inc.
Waltham, MA

NOTES NOTES NOTESNOTES

GRAND TOTAL

GRAND TOTAL (ADD ALTERNATE 1)
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Year Year

2000

6500Disposal of Yard Waste from 
Curbside Collection

15000

2000

2500

Collection and Disposal of 
Logs/Butts

Collection and Disposal of 
Street Sweepings

Collection and Disposal of 
Stumps

Unit PriceYearYear Unit Price

Collection and Disposal of 
Leaves, Grass, Brush, and 

Wood Chips

Estimated 
Quantity 
(Yards)

Item

360 Recycling, LLC
Westfield, MA

THREE YEAR TOTAL

J&J Landscape Supply
Waltham, MA

Mayer Tree Service, Inc.
Essex, MA

Extended Price Unit Price


